
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT 
PRICE BID AMOUNT UNIT 

PRICE BID AMOUNT UNIT 
PRICE BID AMOUNT

BB-01 Silt Fence Erosion Control LF 100 $6.25 $625.00 $6.25 $625.00 $0.38 $38.00
BB-02 Grading LS $8,750.00 $8,750.00 $4,099.00
BB-03 Under drain system LF 240 $18.75 $4,500.00 $18.75 $4,500.00 $18.00 $4,320.00
BB-04 PIP play surface (50% color) SF 4,150 $15.39 $63,868.50 $15.39 $63,868.50 $13.60 $56,440.00
BB-05 6-Inch Concrete walk paving SF 3,070 $11.25 $34,537.50 $11.25 $34,537.50 $10.15 $31,160.50

BB-06 Six swings, single post with two handicap, 
two child and two belt seats LS $5,514.00 $5,514.00 INC. IN 

BB-07
BB-07 2-12 Play Structure LS $72,288.25 $72,612.25 $95,000.00

ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY UNIT 
PRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT 

PRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT 
PRICE AMOUNT BID

BB-01 to  
BB-06

Total of Base Bid items BB-01 through BB-
06 $117,795.00 $117,795.00 $96,057.50

AB-7 2-5 and 5-12 Play Structure LS NO BID NO BID $95,000.00

BIDDER NO. 3

Playworld Midstates Bluemels

CONTRACT 2020-15 ARROWHEAD PARK PLAYGROUND - BID 
TABULATION

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID: NO BID

Playworld Midstates

BIDDER NO. 1

ALTERNATE BID CONSTRUCTION

BASE BID CONSTRUCTION

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID: $190,083.25

NO BID $191,057.50

$190,407.25 $191,057.50

BIDDER NO. 2


